Bid No. 13-26 Bituminous Concrete Materials 3/27/2013

Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM

Tilcon Connecticut Inc. Wescon Cgrp of Pasteryak Asphalt LLC American Industries
Connecticut

Class 1 - Bituminous Concrete, price per ton

2[};‘;3?;;?;* :pﬁm 63.12 66.00 No Bid 61.75

Plant Location: 185 South Rd, Groton, CT 36 EImat:z?xgz,;gwcatuck, n/a 630 Plamé:?f;(_j' Jewett

EECLTVFI)EeF:éCI)Dn: 68.12 72.00 64.60 69.75

Class 2 - Bituminous Concrete, price per ton

SUPPLIER'S PLANT 67.45 66.00 No Bid 65.00

Plant Location: 185 South Rd, Groton, CT 36 Elmatac¢\6%3l;gwcatuck, n/a 630 Plaing:?;figf, Jewett

Prioe per Lon: 72.45 72.00 67.60 75.00

Class 3 - Bituminous Concrete, price per ton

E[Jéepﬁfééc’s” :pﬁm 76.95 70.00 No Bid 72.00

Plant Location: 185 South Rd, Groton, CT 36 Elmatzé¢\6%,3|;3wcatuck, n/a 630 Plaincf:?f;(_j’ Jewett

Price per lon: No Bid 76.00 73.00 82.00

TOWN OF GROTON - FINANCE/PURCHASING, 45 FORT HILL ROAD, GROTON, CT 06340 4/11/2013 (860) 441-6682



Sections 1B & 2B (Delivered
Class 1 and Delivered Class 2)
are for productive "Road"
paving with a maximum 30
minute unload time.

American Industries uses
"Asphalt Weekly Monitor"
under the "East Coast
Market"
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