
Bid No. 15-16 4/16/2015

Town of Groton, Connecticut  06340 2:30 PM

  Item Harrell's, LLC

EH Turf Supply, 

Inc. dba Allens 

Seed

Atlantic Golf & 

Turf

Chas. C. Hart 

Seed Co.

John Deere 

Landscapes

Valley Green 

Inc.

PESTICIDES     Price / Case

Generic Chlorothalonil 148.40 110.00 105.00 122.00 116.00 103.00

 (4 x 5 lb.)
Docket DF-Synganta 2x10 lbs

Daconil Action (2 x 2.5 gal.) 370.00 197.00 370.00 370.00 370.00 369.00

echo 6F ETQ agency priced

Renown (2 x 2.5 gal.) 1,030.00 no bid 1,030.00 1,030.00 1,030.00 1,029.00

agency priced

Secure (2 x 2.5 gal.) 2,825.00 no bid 2,825.00 2,825.00 2,825.00 2,824.00

agency priced

Velista (6 x 22 oz.) 1,122.00 no bid 1,122.00 1,122.00 1,122.00 no bid

agency priced

Banner Maxx (10 gal. linkpak) 2,060.00 no bid 2,060.00 2,060.00 2,060.00 2,059.00

agency priced

Generic Propiconazole 762.70 687.50 350.00 - 575.00 584.00

 (10 gal.)

Dgrado-Syngenta (2 x 2.5 gal) alt/equal

Spectator (2 gal.) - no bid N/B - 398.13 no bid

t&o

Bayleton 50W 2,580.00 no bid N/B 3,000.00 2,586.00 2,579.00

  (34.375 lb. minidrum) 2x2.5 gal / flo agency priced

Chipco 26 GT (2 x 2.5 gal.) 627.50 no bid N/B 579.00 720.00 625.00

Agricultural Supplies
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Generic Iprodione (2 x 2.5 gal.) 227.50 240.00 220.00 220.00 198.00 202.00

Chipco 26019 Flo-

Baye
alt/equal

Emerald (10 x .49 lb.) 1,450.40 1,450.40 1,450.40 - 1,450.40 1,449.00

agency priced

Xzemplar (2 x 114 oz.) 3,052.92 3,052.92 3,052.92 - 3,052.92 3,052.00

agency priced

Lexicon (4 x 21 oz.) 1,689.24 no bid 1,689.24 - 1,689.24 1,689.00

agency priced

Honor (6 x 3 lb.) 3,559.68 2,412.00 2,412.00 - 2,412.00 2,411.00

36 lb drum only size agency priced

Medallion (10 lbs.) 1,100.00 no bid 550.00 1,100.00 550.00 549.00

2 x lg case 1 gallon 2x1 gal / SC 1 gal/agency priced
16L/wettable powder 

no longer available

Curalan / Touche EG 1,250.00 1,139.29 1,196.25 - 960.00 1,063.00

  (12 x 2.75 lb.) curalan

Prostar 70WP (4 x 3 lb.) 765.68 no bid N/B 683.95 668.00 749.00

Scimitar GC (8 x 1 qt.) 1,268.80 no bid 1,268.80 1,066.00 1,032.00 1,075.00

Generic Lambda-Cyhalothrin - 328.00 575.00 - 68.00 580.00

 (8 x 1 qt.)
2x1 gal/ alt/equal

Acelepryn (4 x 64 oz.) 3,710.00 no bid 3,710.00 3,710.00 3,710.00 3,709.00

agency priced

Conserve (4 x 1 qt.) 520.00 625.00 499.00 474.00 416.00 434.00
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Ference (96 oz.) 1,585.00 no bid 1,585.00 1,585.00 1,585.00 no bid

agency priced

Barricade 4FL 1,370.00 no bid 1,370.00 1,370.00 1,370.00 1,369.00

  (10 gal. linkpak) agency priced

Generic Prodiamine - 541.66 450.00 - 697.56 442.00

 (2 x 2.5 gal.)
4L

Dimension 2EW 1,248.00 no bid 1,052.50 1,090.00 930.00 928.00

 (2 x 2.5 gal.)

Drive XLR8 (4 x 64 oz.) 280.00 262.52 275.00 237.00 260.00 242.00

Bensumec 4LF (2 x 2.5 gal.) 640.00 no bid 600.00 - 580.00 590.00

Lontrel (12 x 1 qt.) 2,160.00 no bid 2,000.00 - 1,644.00 1,804.00

Q4 (2 x 2.5 gal.) 600.00 530.00 525.00 - 522.00 495.00

Q4 Plus Quincept

Speedzone (2 x 2.5 gal.) 400.00 398.00 380.00 - 370.00 353.00

Three Way Herbicide 130.00 160.00 150.00 - 178.00 149.00

  (2 x 2.5 gal.) Triplet 5F - NuFarm Triplet triplet alt/equal trimec 99z

Three Way Bent Select Herbicide 130.00 236.00 N/B - 178.00 no bid

 (2 x 2.5 gal.) Trimec Bent Trimec alt/equal

Primo Maxx (10 gal. linkpak) 2,740.00 no bid 2,740.00 2,740.00 2,740.00 2,739.00

agency priced
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Generic Trinexapac-ethyl 1,430.00 1,315.72 628.75 - 1,196.00 589.00

 (10 gal.) 2 + 2.5 gal alt/equal
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FERTILIZERS   Price / Bag, Case

35.00 no bid N/B no bid no bid 49.00

18-9-18

- no bid N/B no bid 36.75 49.00

14-0-26E 13-0-26

40.00 30.88 24.95 no bid 29.00 22.00

(28-7-14) alt/equal 28-7-14

35.00 34.00 N/B no bid no bid 24.00

- no bid 18.75 no bid no bid no bid

- no bid N/B no bid no bid 17.25

24-0-11

- no bid N/B no bid 17.36 16.25

alt/equal 24-0-5

- no bid N/B no bid 31.00 no bid

alt/equal

* Fertilizer substitutes may be considered, but must have same analysis, same nitrogen derivatives, same amount of slow release 

nitrogen, and same type and amount of micronutrients.

22-2-3 20% XCU 52%Ocean Gro 

190 sgn (50 lb. bag)

28-0-3 5% Poly Plus SCU .7%FE 

fairway fertilizer 220sgn (50 lb. 

bag)

28-5-18 Bentgrass formula water 

soluble fertilizer (25 lb. bag)

24-5-11 50% Poly Plus SCU 2%FE 

1% MN fairway fertilizer (50 lb. 

bag)

17-0-19 Greens grade fertilizer 

w/40% Nutralene 37% ammonium 

sulfate 100sgn (50 lb. bag)

28-3-12 Mini Fairway fertilizer 

7.35% Methylene Urea (50 lb. bag)

20-0-20 Bentgrass formula water 

soluble fertilizer (25 lb. bag)

14-0-26 Poly Plus PCU 1% FE .5% 

MN 100 sgn (50 lb. bag)
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- 40.00 23.25 no bid 25.00 20.50

alt/equal

25.00 no bid N/B no bid no bid no bid

30.00 no bid N/B no bid no bid no bid

- no bid N/B no bid 177.44 no bid

Creeping Bentgrass Blend 5.75/lb no bid N/B 9.80 7.80 no bid

  33% Kingpin mackenzie alt/equal

  33% Imperial focus alt/equal

  34% Century cobra II alt/equal

- no bid N/B 8.65 6.634 no bid

mackenzie
2.5 lb bag

alt/equal

19-0-8 75% Polyon ST w/ .17% 

Dimension (50 lb. bag)

Authority Creeping Bentgrass

  Packaged in plastic lined bags or buckets

*Substitute seed blends/mixes may be considered, but they must utilize same percentage breakdowns, and include comparable 

certified seed types.

4-4-5 Liquid Iron 6% Chelated FE 

(2 x 2.5 gal.)

CERTIFIED SEED    Price / Pound

16-4-8 Mini Fairway fertilizer 

14.4% ammoniacal N 1%FE 

145sgn (50 lb. bag)

18-0-9 75% Polyon ST 25% 

ammonium sulfate (50 lb. bag)
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Perennial Rye Blend 1.75/lb 1.66/lb N/B 1.54 1.33 1.38

  33% Notable Turfstar

  33% Prototype (see specs)

  34% Attribute wicked alt/equal

karma

Blue/Rye/Fescue Mix 2.00/lb 2.00/lb N/B 1.97 1.636 1.60

  34% Greenville Perennial Rye trifecta

  33% Shamrock Kentucky Blue volt

garnet alt/equal

Fescue Blend 2.40/lb 2.29/lb N/B 2.19 1.801 no bid

  25% Marco Polo Sheep barok azay

  25% Gotham Hard hard top spartan II

  25% Aruba Creeping Red allens garnet

  25% J-5 Chewings bridgeport II windward alt/equal 

allens
  33% Shademark Creeping Red 

Fescue

fiesta 4
alt/equal

alt/equal

alt/equal

alt/equal

alt/equal

alt/equal

alt/equal

karma

mercury
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