
Bid No. 16-27 4/21/2016

Town of Groton, Connecticut  06340 2:30 PM

  Item Harrell's, LLC
Site One Landscape 

Supply
Metro Turf Specialists

Valley Green 

Incorporated

Seeton Turf 

Warehouse, LLC

PESTICIDES     Price / Case

Generic Chlorothalonil 0.00 129.56/cs 162.50 132.09 129.00

 (4 x 5 lb.) 084897 Manicure Ultra 

82.5% 5lb
DF 

Manicure Ultrex (4 x 5 lb.) 0.00 129.56/cs no bid 202.20 129.00

180 / Daconil Ultrex 084897 720 Armor Tech CLT825

Daconil Action (2 x 2.5 gal.) 380.00 380.00/cs agency 380.00 981.84 Not Bidding

47068

Renown (2 x 2.5 gal.) 1,030.00 1030.00/cs agency 1,030.00 1,030.00 Not Bidding

38680

Secure (2 x 2.5 gal.) 2,915.00 2915.00/cs agency 2,915.00 1,198.00 Not Bidding

47148

Velista (6 x 22 oz.) 1,155.00 1155.00/cs agency 1,155.00 ------- see Xzemplar

55168

Banner Maxx (10 gal. linkpak) 2,080.00 2080.00/cs agency 2,080.00 2,080.00 Not Bidding

39962

Generic Propiconazole 685.00 1105.00 / 10 gal 313.28 / 2 x 2.5gal 612.23 329.00

 (10 gal.)
Dorado 5x2g

Alternate 10160225 Lesco 

Spectator Ultra 2.5 gal
Quali-Pro

Spectator (2 gal.) ------- 447.50 / 2.5 gal no bid ------- Not Bidding

Alternate 10159225 Lesco 

Spectator T+O 2.5 gal

Chipco 26 GT (2 x 2.5 gal.) 600.00 856.38/cs 565.00 701.95 Not Bidding

4250930

Generic Iprodione (2 x 2.5 gal.) ------- 228.00/cs 197.00 229.74 279.00

300 Chipco 26019Flo
Alternate 79972369 18 Plus 

Lesco 2.5 gal
Bayer 26019

Agricultural Supplies
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Bid No. 16-27 4/21/2016

Town of Groton, Connecticut  06340 2:30 PM

  Item Harrell's, LLC
Site One Landscape 

Supply
Metro Turf Specialists

Valley Green 

Incorporated

Seeton Turf 

Warehouse, LLC

Agricultural Supplies

Emerald (10 x .49 lb.) 1,479.80 1479.80/cs agency 1,479.80 1,479.80 1,479.80

59021463

Kabuto (6 x 21.78oz) 0.00 636.00/cs no bid ------- Not Bidding

6421236

Xzemplar (2 x 114 oz.) 3,296.88 3296.88/cs agency 3,296.88 3,296.88 3,296.88

59013833

Lexicon (4 x 21 oz.) 1,824.48 1824.48/cs agency 1,824.48 1,824.48 1,824.48

59013840

Honor (6 x 3 lb.) 2,466.00 2466.00/cs agency 2,466.00 2,466.00 2,466.00

59012350

Medallion (10 lbs.) $1110/2xlg 555.00/gal agency 1,110.00 / 2 x 1gal 11,100.00 Not Bidding

52650 1 gal Medallion 2sc (as written on bid)

Curalan EG ------- 1128.00/cs no bid 1,753.28 Off the Market

  (12 x 2.75 lb.) 59011092

Prostar 70WP (4 x 3 lb.) 870.00 700.00/cs 665.00 774.13 910.20

80007809

Scimitar GC (8 x 1 qt.) 1,350.00 1104.00/cs 1,198.00 1,134.88 Not Bidding

73419

Generic Lambda-Cyhalothrin ------- 156.12/cs 459.40 281.39 552.00

 (8 x 1 qt.) (4x1 gal) Alternate 83013788 

Bifenthrin golf/nursery 7.9% 1 

gal

Acelepryn (4 x 64 oz.) 3,798.00 3798.00/cs agency 3,798.00 3,798.00 Not Bidding

53196

Conserve (4 x 1 qt.) 560.00 448.00/cs 445.00 473.95 500.00

00124042

Ference (96 oz.) 1,620.00 1620.00/cs agency 3,240.00 3,240.00 Not Bidding
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Incorporated
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Agricultural Supplies

55665

Barricade 4FL 1,380.00 1380.00/cs agency 1,380.00 1,380.00 Not Bidding

  (10 gal. linkpak) 37151

Generic Prodiamine ------- 418.00/cs 439.00 465.11 450.00

 (2 x 2.5 gal.) Alternate 83014144 

Prodiamine 4L 2.5 gal

Armor Tech Kade 65WDG 

4x5 lbs covers 20-27 acres

Dimension 2EW 1,157.50 1050.00/cs 1,140.00 525.00 1,050.00

 (2 x 2.5 gal.)
00278317

Drive XLR8 (4 x 64 oz.) 280.00 284.00/cs 280.00 263.48 300.00

59011404

Bensumec 4LF (2 x 2.5 gal.) 660.00 630.00/cs 599.00 621.39 750.00

8451126

Lontrel (12 x 1 qt.) 2,300.00 1704.00/cs 1,872.70 159.01 2,100.00

00129862

Q4 (2 x 2.5 gal.) 600.00 550.00/cs 988.80 276.60 550.00

6971127 Alt. NuFarm Last Call

Speedzone (2 x 2.5 gal.) 400.00 438.00/cs 399.00 383.90 400.00

6541126 Alt. NuFarm 4 Speed XT

Three Way Herbicide Millenium Ultra 350.00/cs 130.00 116.27 149.00

  (2 x 2.5 gal.)
380.00

Alternate 10157225 Lesco 

Redzone 2 2.5gal
Quali-Pro 3D Triplet SF ArmorTech Threesome

Three Way Bent Select Herbicide 250.00 198.00/cs no bid 209.25 Not Bidding

 (2 x 2.5 gal.) Alternate 10152225 Eliminate 

Lo 2.5gal

Primo Maxx (10 gal. linkpak) 2,740.00 2740.00/10 gal agency 2,740.00 2,740.00 Not Bidding

22535

Generic Trinexapac-ethyl 1,525.00 1520.00/10 gal 1,167.56 1,248.83 1,750.00
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 (10 gal.)
Alternate 34062 Podium 

plant growth 1gal
Quali-Pro T-Nex
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Town of Groton, Connecticut  06340 2:30 PM

  Item Harrell's, LLC
Site One Landscape 
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Metro Turf Specialists
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Agricultural Supplies

FERTILIZERS   Price / Bag, Case

35.00 28.39/bag 41.00 blank on bid 51.80 / bag

Alternate 098539 14-2-14E 

97% AsFeMn SGN100 50lb

Nutrite 18-0-18 with 

hydrofaze complete

Anderson's Cotect DG 

SGN75  17-0-17

------- 39.64/bag no bid blank on bid Not Bidding

Alternate 098536 100% 

Polyplus 3MO SOP Fe Mn 

Sgn 100 50lb

35.00 29.00/bag 21.50 blank on bid 33.00 / bag

Alternate 867607 28-5-18 

ProSol Mi CNS 25 lb.
Nutrite 28-7-14

Bulldog Soluble Fert. 

Bentgrass Special 28-8-18

35.00 no bid no bid blank on bid 33.00 / bag

Bulldog Soluble Fert. 

MultiPurpose 20-20-20

------- no bid no bid blank on bid 37.00 / bag

Nature Safe 21-3-7 W/ 40% 

UFLEXX

22-0-11 -- $22.50 24.50/bag no bid blank on bid 29.00 / bag

50% polyon 44.50

Alternate 510115 24-5-11 

50% Polyplus 5Fe 1.5Mn 

50lb

Andersons 23-4-10 80% NSN 

2% FE SOP SGN 150

blank on bid 19.00/bag no bid blank on bid Not Bidding

20-0-20 Hi-Cal Bentgrass formula 

water soluble fertilizer (25 lb. bag)

14-0-26 Poly Plus PCU 1% FE .5% 

MN 100 sgn (50 lb. bag)

* Fertilizer substitutes may be considered, but must have same analysis, same nitrogen derivatives, same amount of slow 

release nitrogen, and same type and amount of micronutrients.

22-2-3 20% XCU 52%Ocean Gro 

190 sgn (50 lb. bag)

28-0-3 5% Poly Plus SCU .7%FE 

fairway fertilizer 220sgn (50 lb. 

bag)

28-5-18 Bentgrass formula water 

soluble fertilizer (25 lb. bag)

24-5-11 50% Poly Plus SCU 2%FE 

1% MN fairway fertilizer (50 lb. 

bag)

17-0-19 Greens grade fertilizer 

w/40% Nutralene 37% ammonium 

sulfate 100sgn (50 lb. bag)
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  Item Harrell's, LLC
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Metro Turf Specialists

Valley Green 

Incorporated
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Agricultural Supplies

Alternate 098638 28-0-3 

20% Polyplus 35% Bio 

0.7 Fe 50lb

blank on bid 27.00/bag no bid blank on bid 29.00 / bag

Alternate 088752 28-3-12 

50% Mu SOP 1.5Fe1Mn

Andersons 23-0-12 w/70% 

NSN and 30 A.S.

18-0-11 50% A.S. -- 27.50 24.00/bag no bid blank on bid 32.00 / bag

Alternate 510442 

ProScope 16-4-8 A/C 

Homog 1Fe Sgn 145

Andersons 16-4-8 90% A.S. 

1% FE SGN 125

25.00 no bid no bid blank on bid 29.00 / bag

Ansdersons 23-0-12 w/70% 

NSN and 30 A.S.

28.00 no bid no bid blank on bid 50.80 / bag

Andersons 24-0-10 MuTech 

L.103 dimension SGN 150

12-0-0     $75/case 168.00/cs no bid blank on bid 350.00 / case

Alternate 088184 Iron + 

Chelated non-staining 4-4-

5 2.5gal

Macrosorb Quelant Minors     

1-2oz/M

Rye/Fescue/Bentgrass Blend blank on bid Blank on bid

  40% Sox Fan Perennial Rye no bid no bid

19-0-8 75% Polyon ST w/ .17% 

Dimension (50 lb. bag)

  Packaged in plastic lined bags or buckets

*Substitute seed blends/mixes may be considered, but they must utilize same percentage breakdowns, and include 

comparable certified seed types.

28-0-3 5% Poly Plus SCU .7%FE 

fairway fertilizer 220sgn (50 lb. 

bag)

4-4-5 Liquid Iron 6% Chelated FE 

(2 x 2.5 gal.)

CERTIFIED SEED    Price / Pound

28-3-12 Mini Fairway fertilizer 

7.35% Methylene Urea (50 lb. bag)

New England Tee + 

Fairway

16-4-8 Mini Fairway fertilizer 

14.4% ammoniacal N 1%FE 

145sgn (50 lb. bag)

18-0-9 75% Polyon ST 25% 

ammonium sulfate (50 lb. bag)
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Metro Turf Specialists
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Incorporated
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  40% Fairmont Chewings Fescue

3.50/lb

Perennial Rye Blend 34% Revenge Per Rye

  33% Notable II 33% Top Gun Per Rye

  33% Evolution 33% Caddieshack

  34% Align 1.90 1.7166 / lb 1.38 / pound 1.26 / lb

1.50 / lb

Ryegrass Blend (see above)

  25% Double Up 1.90 no bid no bid blank on bid

  25% Metolius

  25% Panther

  25% TransAm 1.50 / lb

Fescue Blend $3.00 / lb 2.4294 / lb 2.50 / lb

  40% Gotham Harrells Liinks Blend no bid blank on bid Highland Links Mix

  30% Foxfire 60% Sword hard fescue

  20% Lacrosse 20% Fairmont Chewings

  10% Sheep 10% Oracle red creeping

10% Blue Heron hard fescue

  20% Memorial Creeping 

Bentgrass

New England Tee + 

Fairway

Harrells Premium Rye 

certified

Alternate #30-63-960 

Noble Eagle blend

Alternate #21-29-500 Fine 

FescueLinks blend

Performance GL perennial 

rye - 25% of 4 of either 

Expedite, Benchmark, 

Salinas II, Soxfan, or 

Spark

Performance GL perennial 

rye - 25% of 4 of either 

Expedite, Benchmark, 

Salinas II, Soxfan, or 

Spark
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