Bid No. 16-28 Copier Maintenance 4/26/2016
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Aztec Technologies Ryan Business Systems, Inc.
1ST YEAR WITH TONER 1ST YEAR WITH TONER
OVER- CHARGE OVER- OVER- CHARGE OVER-

COPIER SERIAL COUNT COPY AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR
# MODEL LOCATION NUMBER 7/1/2015 ALLOWANCE CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER
1 CanonlIR 3030 134 Groton Long Pt(OPDS/BId Insp) SUR 00152 313,967 20,000 0.008 160.00 0.01 200.00 0.007 195.00 0.011 295.00
2 Canon NP 6230 68 Groton Long Pt(Emerg Dispatch)  NNS 05230 115,436 5,000 0.008 40.00 0.01 50.00 No Bid No Bid
3 Canon IR 3570 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/upstairs) KFV 08482 503,107 60,000 0.0055 330.00 0.0057 342.00 0.007 360.00 0.011 560.00
4 Canon IR 5050N 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/downstairs) DZA02510 623,088 150,000 0.0043 645.00 0.0046 690.00 0.005 685.00 0.007 965.00
5 Canon NP 6230 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/downstairs) ~ NNS 01500 266,454 5,000 0.008 40.00 0.01 50.00 No Bid No Bid

(with currency vending unit)
6 Canon IR 3225 68 Groton Long Pt Rd (Police/Det) DFH22477 59,065 12,000 0.008 96.00 0.01 120.00 0.007 120.00 0.011 175.00
7 Canon IR 3235 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Chief) DGA15614 232,226 30,000 0.0055 165.00 0.0057 165.00 0.007 240.00 0.011 340.00
8 Canon IR 2200 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Lts) MPG 15195 531,511 25,000 0.008 200.00 0.01 250.00 0.007 250.00 0.011 350.00
9 CanonIR 3570 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Records)  KFV 09889 461,470 20,000 0.0055 110.00 0.0057 114.00 0.007 200.00 0.011 300.00
10 Canon IR 3300 134 Groton long Pt (PW/Admin) MPH 60262 605,096 30,000 0.0055 165.00 0.0057 171.00 0.007 300.00 0.011 400.00
11 Canon IR 5065 134 Groton Long Pt Rd (PW/Admin)  TVW 00145 1,074,907 110,000 0.0043 473.00 0.0046 506.00 0.005 525.00 0.007 700.00
12 Canon IR 3225 108 Groton Long Pt (PW/Highway) DFH25212 75,452 18,000 0.008 144.00 0.01 180.00 0.007 160.00 0.011 225.00
13 Canon IR 3300  Spicer Ave Noank (Parks & Rec) MPH 56518 515,452 26,000 0.0055 143.00 0.0057 148.20 0.007 250.00 0.011 350.00
14 Canon IR 1025if 134 Groton Long Pt (Parks Maint) DLR68715 10,511 5,000 0.008 40.00 0.01 50.00 0.009 75.00 0.012 145.00
15 Canon IR 3035 102 Newtown Rd (Senior Center) SVC04183 872,676 100,000 0.0056 560.00 0.0058 580.00 0.007 600.00 0.011 800.00
16 Canon IR 3235 2 Fort Hill Rd (Social Services) DFW06890 312,714 65,000 0.0055 357.50 0.0057 370.50 0.007 390.00 0.011 540.00
17 Canon IR 3235 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Town Clerk) DFW05830 88,782 13,500 0.0055 74.25 0.0057 76.95 0.007 135.00 0.011 210.00
18 Canon IR 5050N 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Land Rec) DZA02494 208,791 25,000 0.0042 105.00 0.0045 112.50 0.005 225.00 0.007 300.00
19 Canon IR 2020 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Land Rec) KRR07990 177,318 22,500 0.008 180.00 0.01 225.00 0.009 225.00 0.012 325.00
20 Canon IR 4025  Gary Court (WPCF/Admin Building) HRQO03056 41,432 18,000 0.008 144.00 0.01 180.00 0.007 125.00 0.011 195.00
21 Canon IR 4025  Gary Court (WPCF/Trailer) HRQO03249 19,729 9,000 0.008 72.00 0.01 90.00 0.007 90.00 0.011 150.00
22 Canon IR 1025N 45 Fort Hill (Probate) DQX05190 78,309 11,000 0.008 88.00 0.01 110.00 0.009 125.00 0.012 200.00
23 Canon IR 4051 45 Fort Hill Rd (Town Hall/H.R.) HRMO03199 168,747 85,000 0.0043 365.50 0.0046 391.00 0.007 425.00 0.011 625.00
865,000 TOTAL: 4,697.25 5,172.15 TOTAL: 5,700.00 8,150.00
2 copiers not quoted
2nd Year of Contract 4,697.25 5,172.15 5,700.00 8,150.00
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Bid No. 16-28 Copier Maintenance 4/26/2016
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Aztec Technologies Ryan Business Systems, Inc.
1ST YEAR WITH TONER 1ST YEAR WITH TONER
OVER- CHARGE OVER- OVER- CHARGE OVER-
COPIER SERIAL COUNT COPY AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR
# MODEL LOCATION NUMBER 7/1/2015 ALLOWANCE CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER
3rd Year of Contract 4,697.25 5,172.15 5,700.00 8,150.00
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Bid No. 16-28 Copier Maintenance 4/26/2016
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
LDI Mohegan LLC, dba KOTA LogixService Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services
1ST YEAR WITH TONER 1ST YEAR WITH TONER
OVER- CHARGE OVER- OVER- CHARGE OVER-

COPIER SERIAL COUNT CoPY AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR
# MODEL LOCATION NUMBER 7/1/2015 ALLOWANCE CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER
1 Canon IR 3030 134 Groton Long Pt(OPDS/BId Insp)  SUR 00152 313,967 20,000 [fblank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
2 Canon NP 6230 68 Groton Long Pt(Emerg Dispatch)  NNS 05230 115,436 5,000 blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
3 Canon IR 3570 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/upstairs) KFV 08482 503,107 60,000 "blank on bid form "blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
4 Canon IR 5050N 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/downstairs) DZA02510 623,088 150,000 |[|blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
5 Canon NP 6230 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/downstairs) ~ NNS 01500 266,454 5,000 blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014

(with currency vending unit)
6 Canon IR 3225 68 Groton Long Pt Rd (Police/Det) DFH22477 59,065 12,000 ||blank on bid form ||blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
7 Canon IR 3235 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Chief) DGA15614 232,226 30,000 |blank on bid form |blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
8 Canon IR 2200 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Lts) MPG 15195 531,511 25,000 |[[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
9 Canon IR 3570 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Records)  KFV 09889 461,470 20,000 |[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
10 Canon IR 3300 134 Groton long Pt (PW/Admin) MPH 60262 605,096 30,000 [[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
11 Canon IR 5065 134 Groton Long Pt Rd (PW/Admin)  TVW 00145 1,074,907 110,000 |[|blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
12 Canon IR 3225 108 Groton Long Pt (PW/Highway) DFH25212 75,452 18,000 ||blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
13 Canon IR 3300  Spicer Ave Noank (Parks & Rec) MPH 56518 515,452 26,000 ||blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
14 Canon IR 1025if 134 Groton Long Pt (Parks Maint) DLR68715 10,511 5,000 [[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
15 Canon IR 3035 102 Newtown Rd (Senior Center) SVC04183 872,676 100,000 |[|blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
16 Canon IR 3235 2 Fort Hill Rd (Social Services) DFW06890 312,714 65,000 [[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
17 Canon IR 3235 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Town Clerk) DFW05830 88,782 13,500 ||blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
18 Canon IR 5050N 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Land Rec) DZA02494 208,791 25,000 |[[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
19 Canon IR 2020 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Land Rec) KRR07990 177,318 22,500 |[[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
20 Canon IR 4025 Gary Court (WPCF/Admin Building) HRQO03056 41,432 18,000 ||blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
21 Canon IR 4025  Gary Court (WPCF/Trailer) HRQ03249 19,729 9,000 [[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
22 Canon IR 1025N 45 Fort Hill (Probate) DQX05190 78,309 11,000 |lblank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
23 Canon IR 4051 45 Fort Hill Rd (Town Hall/H.R.) HRM03199 168,747 85,000 |[[blank on bid form blank on bid form 0 0.014 0 0.014
865,000 TOTAL: 0.00 0.00 TOTAL: 0.34 0.34
2nd Year of Contract 9,387.83 11,044.50 0.0120 .0140 CPP
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Bid No. 16-28 Copier Maintenance 4/26/2016
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
LDI Mohegan LLC, dba KOTA LogixService Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services
1ST YEAR WITH TONER 1ST YEAR WITH TONER
OVER- CHARGE OVER- OVER- CHARGE OVER-
COPIER SERIAL COUNT COPY AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR
# MODEL LOCATION NUMBER 7/1/2015 ALLOWANCE CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER
3rd Year of Contract 9,387.83 11,044.50 0.0120 .0140 CPP
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Bid No. 16-28 Copier Maintenance 4/26/2016
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Dynamic Advantage
1ST YEAR WITH TONER
OVER- CHARGE OVER-

COPIER SERIAL COUNT COPY AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR
# MODEL LOCATION NUMBER 7/1/2015 ALLOWANCE CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER
1 CanonlIR 3030 134 Groton Long Pt(OPDS/BId Insp) SUR 00152 313,967 20,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
2 Canon NP 6230 68 Groton Long Pt(Emerg Dispatch)  NNS 05230 115,436 5,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
3 Canon IR 3570 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/upstairs) KFV 08482 503,107 60,000 0.02 1,200.00 0.026 1,520.00
4 Canon IR 5050N 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/downstairs) DZA02510 623,088 150,000 0.02 3,000.00 0.026 3,900.00
5 Canon NP 6230 45 Fort Hill Rd (Finance/downstairs) ~ NNS 01500 266,454 5,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00

(with currency vending unit)
6 Canon IR 3225 68 Groton Long Pt Rd (Police/Det) DFH22477 59,065 12,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
7 Canon IR 3235 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Chief) DGA15614 232,226 30,000 0.02 600.00 0.026 780.00
8 Canon IR 2200 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Lts) MPG 15195 531,511 25,000 0.02 500.00 0.026 650.00
9 Canon IR 3570 68 Groton Long Pt (Police/Records)  KFV 09889 461,470 20,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
10 Canon IR 3300 134 Groton long Pt (PW/Admin) MPH 60262 605,096 30,000 0.02 600.00 0.026 780.00
11 Canon IR 5065 134 Groton Long Pt Rd (PW/Admin)  TVW 00145 1,074,907 110,000 0.02 2,200.00 0.026 2,860.00
12 Canon IR 3225 108 Groton Long Pt (PW/Highway) DFH25212 75,452 18,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
13 Canon IR 3300  Spicer Ave Noank (Parks & Rec) MPH 56518 515,452 26,000 0.02 500.00 0.026 676.00
14 Canon IR 1025if 134 Groton Long Pt (Parks Maint) DLR68715 10,511 5,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
15 Canon IR 3035 102 Newtown Rd (Senior Center) SVC04183 872,676 100,000 0.02 2,000.00 0.026 2,600.00
16 Canon IR 3235 2 Fort Hill Rd (Social Services) DFWO06890 312,714 65,000 0.02 1,300.00 0.026 1,690.00
17 Canon IR 3235 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Town Clerk) DFWO05830 88,782 13,500 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
18 Canon IR 5050N 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Land Rec) DZA02494 208,791 25,000 0.02 500.00 0.026 650.00
19 Canon IR 2020 45 Fort Hill (Town Hall/Land Rec) KRR07990 177,318 22,500 0.02 400.00 0.026 585.00
20 Canon IR 4025  Gary Court (WPCF/Admin Building) HRQO03056 41,432 18,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
21 Canon IR 4025  Gary Court (WPCF/Trailer) HRQO03249 19,729 9,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
22 Canon IR 1025N 45 Fort Hill (Probate) DQX05190 78,309 11,000 0.02 400.00 0.026 520.00
23 Canon IR 4051 45 Fort Hill Rd (Town Hall/H.R.) HRMO03199 168,747 85,000 0.02 1,700.00 0.026 2,210.00
865,000 TOTAL: 18,900.00 24,621.00
2nd Year of Contract 18,900.00 24,621.00
TOWN OF GROTON - FINANCE/PURCHASING, 45 FORT HILL ROAD, GROTON, CT 06340 4/28/2016
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Bid No. 16-28 Copier Maintenance 4/26/2016
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Dynamic Advantage
1ST YEAR WITH TONER
OVER- CHARGE OVER-
COPIER SERIAL COUNT COPY AGE (DRUM AGE 1ST YEAR
# MODEL LOCATION NUMBER 7/1/2015 ALLOWANCE CHARGE INCLUDED) CHARGE W/ TONER
3rd Year of Contract 18,900.00 24,621.00
TOWN OF GROTON - FINANCE/PURCHASING, 45 FORT HILL ROAD, GROTON, CT 06340 4/28/2016
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