Bid No. 19-02 RFP SOLID WASTE COLLECTIONS SERVICES 12/17/2018
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Year 1

Location Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Recycling Recycling Recycling
Container Sz/Frequency Town Pays Disposal | Hauler Pays Disposal Container Sz/Frequency Single Stream | Separate Stream
Monthly Charge Monthly Charge Monthly Charge | Monthly Charge
Town Hall Annex 40yd compactor, on call $300.00 rental* 4yd CB, once per week $65.00
5-90gal toters, once per week $100.00
Senior Center 8yd, twice per week $550.00 4yd CB, once per week $65.00
2-90gal toters, once per week $40.00
Library 6yd, once per week $225.00 2yd CB, every other week $30.00
3-90gal toters, once per week $60.00
Social Services 6yd, once per week $225.00 2yd CB, once per week $40.00
2-90gal toters, once per week $40.00
Spicer House 1-90gal toter, once per week $30.00 2-90gal toters, once per week $40.00
1-90gal tote, once per week $20.00
Transfer Station No trash
10yd CB, once per week $125.00
Golf Course 2yd, three times per week $225.00 1-90gal tote, once per week $20.00
1-90gal tote, once per month $15.00
Groton Shopping Plaza 2 trash barrels, three times per week $150.00
1 recycle barrel, once per week $30.00
Town Hall 8yd, once per week $250.00 2yd CB, once per week $40.00
3-90gal toters, once per week $60.00
WPCF 2yd, every other week $50.00 2yd CB, every other week $30.00
4yd, once per week $155.00 2-90gal toters, once per week $40.00
2yd screeners, on call i
Total No bid $2,160.00 Total No bid $860.00
*Compactor haul charge is also $175.10/haul and disposal fee of SCARRA current fee plus $4.00/ton; **2yd screeners charged at $87.55 each/pickup
Receipt of Addendum(s) Yes
Exceptions: No
Vendor: CWPM, LLC, 25 Norton Place, Plainville, CT 06062
Email: jam@cwpm.net
Telephone: 860-447-1473
Emergency Telephone: 860-420-6062
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Bid No. 19-02 RFP SOLID WASTE COLLECTIONS SERVICES 12/17/2018

Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Year 1
Year 2
Location Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Recycling Recycling Recycling
Container Sz/Frequency Town Pays Disposal | Hauler Pays Disposal Container Sz/Frequency Single Stream | Separate Stream
Monthly Charge Monthly Charge Monthly Charge | Monthly Charge
Town Hall Annex 40yd compactor, on call $309.00 rental* 4yd CB, once per week $66.95
5-90gal toters, once per week $103.00
Senior Center 8yd, twice per week $566.50 4yd CB, once per week $66.95
2-90gal toters, once per week $41.20
Library 6yd, once per week $231.75 2yd CB, every other week $30.90
3-90gal toters, once per week $61.80
Social Services 6yd, once per week $231.75 2yd CB, once per week $41.20
2-90gal toters, once per week $41.20
Spicer House 1-90gal toter, once per week $30.90 2-90gal toters, once per week $41.20
1-90gal tote, once per week $20.60
Transfer Station No trash
10yd CB, once per week $128.75
Golf Course 2yd, three times per week $231.75 1-90gal tote, once per week $20.60
1-90gal tote, once per month $15.45
Groton Shopping Plaza 2 trash barrels, three times per week $154.50
1 recycle barrel, once per week $30.90
Town Hall 8yd, once per week $257.50 2yd CB, once per week $41.20
3-90gal toters, once per week $61.80
WPCF 2yd, every other week $51.50 2yd CB, every other week $30.90
4yd, once per week $159.65 2-90gal toters, once per week $41.20
2yd screeners, on call i
Total No bid $2,224.80 Total No bid $885.80

*Compactor haul charge is also $175.10/haul and disposal fee of SCARRA current fee plus $4.00/ton; **2yd screeners charged at $87.55 each/pickup
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Bid No. 19-02 RFP SOLID WASTE COLLECTIONS SERVICES 12/17/2018
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Year 1
Year 3

Location Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Recycling Recycling Recycling
Container Sz/Frequency Town Pays Disposal | Hauler Pays Disposal Container Sz/Frequency Single Stream | Separate Stream
Monthly Charge Monthly Charge Monthly Charge | Monthly Charge
Town Hall Annex 40yd compactor, on call $318.27 rental* 4yd CB, once per week $68.96
5-90gal toters, once per week $106.09
Senior Center 8yd, twice per week $583.50 4yd CB, once per week $68.96
2-90gal toters, once per week $42.44
Library 6yd, once per week $238.70 2yd CB, every other week $31.83
3-90gal toters, once per week $63.65
Social Services 6yd, once per week $238.70 2yd CB, once per week $42.44
2-90gal toters, once per week $42.44
Spicer House 1-90gal toter, once per week $31.80 2-90gal toters, once per week $42.44
1-90gal tote, once per week $21.22
Transfer Station No trash
10yd CB, once per week $132.61
Golf Course 2yd, three times per week $238.70 1-90gal tote, once per week $21.22
1-90gal tote, once per month $15.91
Groton Shopping Plaza 2 trash barrels, three times per week $159.14
1 recycle barrel, once per week $31.83
Town Hall 8yd, once per week $265.23 2yd CB, once per week $42.44
3-90gal toters, once per week $63.65
WPCF 2yd, every other week $53.05 2yd CB, every other week $31.83
4yd, once per week $164.44 2-90gal toters, once per week $42.44
2yd screeners, on call *k
Total No bid $2,291.53 Total No bid $912.40
*Compactor haul charge is also $175.10/haul and disposal fee of SCARRA current fee plus $4.00/ton; **2yd screeners charged at $87.55 each/pickup
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Bid No. 19-02 RFP SOLID WASTE COLLECTIONS SERVICES 12/17/2018
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Year 1
Year 4

Location Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Recycling Recycling Recycling
Container Sz/Frequency Town Pays Disposal | Hauler Pays Disposal Container Sz/Frequency Single Stream | Separate Stream
Monthly Charge Monthly Charge Monthly Charge | Monthly Charge
Town Hall Annex 40yd compactor, on call $327.82 rental* 4yd CB, once per week $71.03
5-90gal toters, once per week $109.27
Senior Center 8yd, twice per week $601.00 4yd CB, once per week $71.03
2-90gal toters, once per week $43.71
Library 6yd, once per week $245.86 2yd CB, every other week $32.78
3-90gal toters, once per week $65.56
Social Services 6yd, once per week $245.86 2yd CB, once per week $43.71
2-90gal toters, once per week $43.71
Spicer House 1-90gal toter, once per week $32.78 2-90gal toters, once per week $43.71
1-90gal tote, once per week $21.85
Transfer Station No trash
10yd CB, once per week $136.59
Golf Course 2yd, three times per week $245.86 1-90gal tote, once per week $21.85
1-90gal tote, once per month $16.39
Groton Shopping Plaza 2 trash barrels, three times per week $163.91
1 recycle barrel, once per week $32.78
Town Hall 8yd, once per week $273.18 2yd CB, once per week $43.71
3-90gal toters, once per week $65.56
WPCF 2yd, every other week $54.64 2yd CB, every other week $32.78
4yd, once per week $169.37 2-90gal toters, once per week $43.71
2yd screeners, on call *k
Total No bid $2,360.28 Total No bid $939.73
*Compactor haul charge is also $175.10/haul and disposal fee of SCARRA current fee plus $4.00/ton; **2yd screeners charged at $87.55 each/pickup
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Bid No. 19-02 RFP SOLID WASTE COLLECTIONS SERVICES 12/17/2018
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340 2:30 PM
Year 1
Year 5

Location Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Acceptable Waste Recycling Recycling Recycling
Container Sz/Frequency Town Pays Disposal | Hauler Pays Disposal Container Sz/Frequency Single Stream | Separate Stream
Monthly Charge Monthly Charge Monthly Charge | Monthly Charge
Town Hall Annex 40yd compactor, on call $337.65 rental* 4yd CB, once per week $73.16
5-90gal toters, once per week $112.55
Senior Center 8yd, twice per week $619.03 4yd CB, once per week $73.16
2-90gal toters, once per week $45.02
Library 6yd, once per week $253.24 2yd CB, every other week $33.77
3-90gal toters, once per week $67.53
Social Services 6yd, once per week $253.24 2yd CB, once per week $45.02
2-90gal toters, once per week $45.02
Spicer House 1-90gal toter, once per week $33.77 2-90gal toters, once per week $45.02
1-90gal tote, once per week $22.51
Transfer Station No trash
10yd CB, once per week $140.69
Golf Course 2yd, three times per week $253.24 1-90gal tote, once per week $22.51
1-90gal tote, once per month $16.88
Groton Shopping Plaza 2 trash barrels, three times per week $168.83
1 recycle barrel, once per week $33.77
Town Hall 8yd, once per week $281.38 2yd CB, once per week $45.02
3-90gal toters, once per week $67.53
WPCF 2yd, every other week $56.28 2yd CB, every other week $33.77
4yd, once per week $174.45 2-90gal toters, once per week $45.02
2yd screeners, on call *k
Total No bid $2,431.11 Total No bid $967.95
*Compactor haul charge is also $175.10/haul and disposal fee of SCARRA current fee plus $4.00/ton; **2yd screeners charged at $87.55 each/pickup
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