
West Side Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.02 - BUILDING ABATEMENT AND DEMOLITION

CONTRACTOR NAME

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

Alternate No. 1 - 

Exterior Roofing 

Materials, 

Skylights and 

Sealants PCBs 

>50 ppm

Alternate No. 2 - 

Interior Roofing 

Debris PCBs >50 

ppm

Alternate No. 3 - 

Painted Metal 

Ceilings 

throughout PCBs 

>50 ppm

Alternate No. 4 - 

Painted Metal 

Materials 

throughout PCBs 

>50 ppm

Alternate No. 5 - 

Painted Metal 

Columns and 

Beams throughout 

PCBs >50 ppm

Alternate No. 6 - 

Painted Ceilings 

and Walls 

throughtout PCBs 

>50 ppm

Alternate No. 7 - 

Gymnasium 

Flooring Materials  

PCBs >50 ppm

Alternate No. 8 - 

Tunnel/Crawl 

Space Tar Paper 

Ceiling Material  

PCBs >50 ppm

Alternate No. 9 - 

Stage Tar Paper 

Flooring Material 

PCBs >50 ppm

Alternate No. 10 - 

Slate Flooring 

Materials PCBs 

>50 ppm

Alternate No. 11 - 

Old Kitchen Areas, 

Toilet Rooms, 

Bathrooms, 

Locker Rooms, 

Shower Rooms 

throughout PCBs 

>50 ppm

Alternate No. 14 - 

Separate Portable 

Classroom 

Building in lieu of 

Demolition ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Stamford Wrecking Company $1,339,750 $0 $110,000 $31,700 $41,750 $83,500 $167,000 $42,800 $111,700 $11,000 $24,600 $98,500 $45,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

AAIS Corporation a Division of Spectrum 
Environmental, LLC $1,579,375 $42,110 $297,450 $163,130 $669,270 $268,150 $140,025 $203,185 $48,185 $7,400 $234,710 $113,100 -$8,000 1-5 ✓ ✓

Wiese Construction, Inc. $1,978,000 $374,000 $50,000 $30,000 $64,000 $32,500 $231,850 $25,800 $50,000 $20,000 $25,000 $68,800 1-6 ✓ ✓

Manafort Brothers Inc. $2,075,000 $36,600 $2,700 $75,600 $95,300 $435,000 $659,000 $3,700 $55,350 $9,850 $2,200 $71,275 1-6 ✓ ✓

American Environmental Inc. $2,147,000 $315,000 $50,000 $20,000 $35,000 $40,000 $220,000 $48,000 $40,000 $20,000 $60,000 $80,000 -$8,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

Bestech Inc. of CT $2,400,000 $15,000 $10,000 $4,000 $15,000 $30,000 $17,500 $9,500 $10,500 $4,500 $9,100 $15,500 -$1,500 1-6 ✓ ✓

Southern Middlesex Industries, Inc. $2,647,777 $65,000 $35,000 $25,000 $30,000 $350,000 $60,000 $15,000 $85,000 $12,500 $80,000 $60,000 1-6 ✓ ✓



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.02 - BUILDING ABATEMENT AND DEMOLITION

CONTRACTOR NAME CUTLER ES BASE BID

Alternate No. 1 - 

Terrazzo, Ceramic 

Tile and Flagstone 

PCB >1 ppm and 

<50 ppm

Alternate No. 2 - 

Terrazzo, Ceramic 

Tile and Flagstone 

PCBs >50 ppm

Alternate No. 3 - 

Disposal of Waste 

Stream No. 4 

PCBs >1 ppm and 

<50 ppm

Alternate No. 4 - 

Disposal of Waste 

Stream No. 4 

PCBs >50 ppm

Alternate No. 5 - 

Disposal of Waste 

Stream No. 5 

PCBs >1 ppm and 

<50 ppm

Alternate No. 6 - 

Disposal of Waste 

Stream No. 5 

PCBs >50 ppm

Alternate No. 9 - 

Separate Portable 

Classroom 

Building in lieu of 

Demolition ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

American Environmental Inc. $1,290,000 $12,000 $18,000 $18,000 $25,000 $60,000 $120,000 -$8,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Stamford Wrecking Company $1,421,995 $144,000 $154,000 $185,300 $208,725 $74,100 $83,500 -$10,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Manafort Brothers Inc. $1,531,600 $157,000 $157,000 $275,000 $360,000 $615,000 $615,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Bestech Inc. of CT $1,585,000 $9,500 $18,500 $162,000 $221,000 $98,000 $113,000 $2,500 1-8 ✓ ✓

AAIS Corporation a Division of Spectrum 
Environmental LLC $1,645,000 $119,300 $127,110 $240,500 $322,620 $232,330 $242,765 -$15,125 1-7 ✓ ✓

Southern Middlesex Industries Inc. $2,366,666 $20,000 $30,000 $65,000 $85,000 $250,000 $300,000 1-9 ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.02 - BUILDING ABATEMENT AND DEMOLITION

CONTRACTOR NAME

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO                                     

BASE BID Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5 Alternate No. 6 Alternate No. 7 Alternate No. 8 Alternate No. 9 Alternate No. 10 Alternate No. 11

Alternate - 

Separate Portable 

Classroom 

Building in lieu of 

Demolition ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

AAIS Corporation $3,063,150 $161,410 $424,560 $403,620 $991,890 $500,480 $382,790 $203,185 $48,150 $7,400 $243,710 $113,100 $23,125 1-7 ✓ ✓

Manafort Brothers, Inc. $3,606,600 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 1-9 ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.03 - CONCRETE

B&W Paving & Landscaping, LLC $1,755,000 ✓ ✓

Capasso Enterprises $1,520,000 $1,857,000 $3,347,000
1-9
1-6 ✓ ✓

Carvalho & McDowell Construction, Inc. $1,512,000 $1,771,000
1-6
1-8 ✓ ✓

Manafort Brothers, Inc. 1,784,000 2,313,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Marguerite Concrete, Inc. 1,357,000 1,639,000
1-8
1-6 ✓ ✓

McCarthy Concrete Inc. 1,346,000 1-8 ✓ ✓

MT Ford Industries, Inc. 1,478,000 1,690,000 $3,160,000
1-6
1-9 ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.04 - MASONRY

Acranom Masonry, Inc. $2,564,000 $3,000,000 $5,464,000
1-8
1-6 ✓ ✓

Capasso Enterprises, Inc. 2,736,000 2,867,000 $5,543,000
1-9
1-6 ✓ ✓

Connecticut Mason Contractors, Inc. $2,493,000 $2,553,000 $4,997,000
1-9
1-6 ✓ ✓

Fernandes Masonry, Inc. $2,785,000 $3,085,000 $5,870,000
1-8
1-6 ✓ ✓

Mid-State Mason Contractors, Inc. $2,483,000 1-8 ✓ ✓

Noble Construction & Management $3,185,000 $2,950,000
1-8
1-6 ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools
Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.05m - MISCELLANEOUS METALS

General Welding & Fabrication $145,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Steeltech Building Products $148,367 $248,291
1-9
1-6 ✓

N/A

QSR Steel Corporation $364,000 $380,000
1-9
1-6 ✓ N/A

Haven Steel Erectors, Inc.

United Steel, Inc.

Pro Iron, LLC $386,900 1-6 ✓ N/A

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID
ADDENDA BID BOND



West Side Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.05s - STRUCTURAL STEEL

CONTRACTOR NAME BASE BID ADDENDA BID BOND
CTDAS UPDATE 

STATEMENT

QSR Steel Corporation $2,520,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

Schenectady Steel Co., Inc. $2,150,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

Shepard Steel Co., Inc. $2,179,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

Steeltech Building Products, Inc. $1,959,328 1-6 ✓ ✓

STS Steel, Inc. $2,550,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

United Steel, Inc. $1,993,000 1-6 ✓ ✓



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 11, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.05s - STRUCTURAL STEEL

CONTRACTOR NAME BASE BID ADDENDA BID BOND
CTDAS UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Steeltech Building Products, Inc. $1,959,328 1-6 ✓ ✓

United Steel, Inc. $1,993,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

Schenectady Steel Co., Inc. $2,150,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

Shepard Steel Co., Inc. $2,179,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

QSR Steel Corporation $2,520,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

STS Steel, Inc. $2,550,000 1-6 ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary Schools
Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.06 - ARCHITECTURAL CABINETS AND WOODWORK

NE Interior Systems of New England, Inc. $627,770 $736,213 $1,343,983
1-7
1-5 ✓ ✓

Nova Wood Products Limited $644,400 $603,600
1-8
1-6 ✓ ✓

OWI Contractors LLC $749,600 $759,500 $1,436,300
1-8
1-8 ✓ ✓

Connecticut Carpentry Corp. $775,000 $769,000 $1,509,000
1-9
1-6 ✓ ✓

Desco Professional Builders $1,744,680
1-6
1-8 ✓ ✓

Legere Group, Ltd. $661,955 1-6 ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools
Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.07f - FIRESTOPPING

Cutler ES West Side

Stonington Services, LLC dba Brand 
Services $58,000 1-7 N/A N/A

New Haven Firestop Systems LLC $45,000 $38,000

2 C
4 W N/A N/A

ALTERNATE NO. ______

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE           

NO. ________

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA
BID BOND

Not Required



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.07r - ROOFING

CONTRACTOR NAME

CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID ADDENDA BID BOND

Cutler ES West Side

Commercial Roofing & 
Contracting, Inc. $968,000 $1,065,000 $43,000 $42,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Greenwood Industries, Inc. $873,000 $906,000 $1,767,000 $23,000 $23,000 $46,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

The Imperial Company, 
Restoration Contractor, Inc. $939,100 $915,000 $1,844,800 $24,650 $25,400 $50,050

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Silktown Roofing, Inc. $862,200 $843,000 $24,000 $23,500

1-6 W
1-9 C

✓ C
W No ✓

Young Developers, LLC $787,000 $797,000 $1,555,000 $15,000 $15,000 $30,000

1-6 W
1-8 C ✓ ✓

Alternate - Provide 30-year warranty for the specified 75-mil EPDM roofing

ALTERNATE Provide 30-

year warranty for the 

specified 75-mil EPDM 

roofing

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE 30-

Year Warranty 

for EPDM 

Roofing

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.08 - ALUMINUM ENTRANCES, STOREFRONTS AND CURTAINWALL

Accurate Door & Window, LLC $1,938,000 $2,168,000 $3,962,200

1-9 C
1-6 W ✓ ✓

Lockheed Window Corp. $2,008,000 $2,213,000 $4,167,000

1-9 C
1-6 W ✓ ✓

Massey's Plate Glass & Aluminum $2,109,000 $2,432,000 $4,440,000

1-8 C
1-6 W ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.09a - ACOUSTICAL

Acoustics, Inc. $579,763 $593,776

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓

✓ W
N C

Central Conn Acoustics Inc. $409,654 $450,900

1-6 W
1-8 C ✓ ✓

Conn Acoustics, Inc. $426,330 $445,967

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

H. Carr & Sons, Inc. $388,000 $424,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

J&J Acoustics, LLC $940,150

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

N.T. Oliva inc. $442,000 $436,700

1-6 W
1-9 C

✓ C
N W ✓

Professional Drywall Construction Inc. $764,000 $766,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.09d - DRYWALL

CONTRACTOR NAME

CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID ADDENDA BID BOND

Cutler ES

#7

West Side

#12

Acoustics, Inc. $2,187,000 $2,324,500 $0
1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Conn Acoustics, Inc. $2,168,873 $1,970,052

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

GDS Contracting Corp. $2,258,420 $2,284,420 $5,000 $5,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

H. Carr & Sons, Inc. $2,044,800 $2,075,800 $2,700 $2,600

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Interior Building Contractors $2,325,000 $2,350,000 $4,650,000

1-5 W
1-7 C ✓ ✓

Professional Drywall, Inc. $2,415,000 $2,387,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Alternate - Provide ceramic wall tile in Cafeteria in lieu of Epoxy Paint

ALTERNATE Provide 

ceramic wall tile in 

Cafeteria in lieu of Epoxy 

Paint

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT



Groton Elementary Schools
Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.09f - CARPET, RESILIENT AND RESINOUS FLOORING

CONTRACTOR NAME

CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID ADDENDA BID BOND

Cutler ES West Side Cutler ES West Side

Barall & Konover Floors, Inc. $550,000 $558,000 $1,080,000 $77,180 $72,055 $169,235 $113,278 $108,030 $221,308
1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

The John Boyle Co., Inc. $499,885 $24,000 $19,500 1-9 C ✓ ✓

R&B Ceramic Tile & Floorcovering $569,000 $560,000 $19,000 $51,000 $25,000 $16,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Spectrum Floors, Inc. $571,952 $567,932 $1,129,884 $82,470 $89,950 $169,695 $84,799 $89,700 $172,754

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Alternate - Provide Ceramic Wall Tile in Cafeteria in lieu of Epoxy Paint

Alternate - Provide LVT in lieu of VCT as noted in Finish Legend

ALTERNATE Provide 

Ceramic Wall Tile in 

Cafeteria in lieu of Epoxy 

Paint

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE 

Ceramic Wall 

Tile in Cafeteria   

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

ALTERNATE Provide LVT in 

lieu of VCT as noted in 

Finish Legend

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE 

LVT in lieu of 

VCT



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.09p - PAINTING

CONTRACTOR NAME

CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA

West Side|

Cutler BID BOND

Cutler ES West Side

MacKenzie Service Corp. $171,965 $183,560 -$360 -$360

1-6
1-8 ✓ N/A

Goodco Painting $197,770 $188,800 $381,100 -$800 -$800 -$1,600

1-6
1-8 ✓ N/A

Professional Painting $207,100 $189,000 -$400 -$400

1-6
1-9 ✓ N/A

M&P Painting Company $238,000 $218,000 -$800 -$800

1-6
1-9 ✓ N/A

M. Brett Painting Company $244,440 -$2,175 1-6 ✓ N/A

Alternate - Provide ceramic wall tile in Cafeteria in lieu of Epoxy Paint

ALTERNATE Provide 

ceramic wall tile in 

Cafeteria in lieu of Epoxy 

Paint

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE 

Ceramic Wall 

Tile in Cafeteria

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.09w - WOOD FLOORING

Barall & Konover Floors $102,150 $102,150 $198,500 ✓ ✓ ✓

Dalene Hardwood Flooring Co. $106,695 $106,695 $206,360 ✓ ✓ ✓

Kenvo Floor Co. Inc.
$88,690

$88,580 No Bond ✓

No-Combo
✓ N/A

R&B Ceramic Tile & Floorcovering $95,000 $99,000

Rainbow Floor Installation

Kiefer Northeast LLC $190,500 $97,250 ✓ ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.10 - GENERAL TRADES

CONTRACTOR NAME

CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID ADDENDA BID BOND

Cutler ES West Side

Connecticut Carpentry Corp. $1,199,500 $1,246,700 $2,406,200 $38,940 $38,940 $77,880 ✓ ✓ ✓

Noble Construction & Management $1,017,000 $1,005,000 $2,000,000 $43,800 $43,800 $87,600 ✓ ✓ ✓

Nosal Builders $1,580,200 $1,555,500 $72,890 $39,200 ✓ ✓ ✓

OWI Contractors, LLC $1,498,634 $1,434,374 $2,849,300 No Bid No Bid No Bid ✓ ✓ ✓

RJF Associates, LLC, dba Tomlinson 
Hawley Patterson $1,249,000 $1,249,000 $2,478,000 $50,000 $50,000 $95,000 ✓ ✓ ✓

Sarazin General Contractors $1,332,000 $1,355,000 $60,000 $40,000 ✓ ✓ ✓

Scope Construction Co. $1,210,000 $1,193,000 $2,289,700 $52,000 $29,250 $81,250 ✓ ✓ ✓

W.J. Mountford Co. $1,388,000 $1,388,000 $2,735,000 $49,000 $29,000 $78,000 ✓ ✓ ✓

Alternate - Separate Portable Classroom Building in lieu of Demolition

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

ALTERNATE Separate 

Portable Classroom 

Building in lieu of 

Demolition

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE 

Separate 

Portable 

Classrooms 



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.11 - FOOD SERVICE EQUIPMENT

11400 Inc. $560,400

1-9 C
1-6 W

✓ N/A

B & G Restaurant Supply $312,694
✓ N/A

Kittredge Equipment, Inc. $280,182 or $282,182 $282,124

1-6 W
1-5 C

✓ N/A

Sam Tell & Son Inc. $304,000 $303,000

1 W
1-3 C

✓ N/A

Singer Equipment $310,432 $309,625 $604,057

1-5 W
1-8 C

✓ N/A

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.12 - WINDOW TREATMENTS

The John Boyle Co., Inc. $84,500 $84,500 $160,550

1-6 W
1-9 C N/A N/A

Olson Backman, LLC $73,738 $75,245 $148,983

1-6 W
1-8 C N/A N/A

Turner Commercial Products $104,698 $105,834 $204,985

1-6 W
1-8 C N/A N/A

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA
BID BOND

Not Required



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.21 - FIRE PROTECTION

HHS Mechanical Contractors $412,000 1-6 W ✓ N/A

M.J. Daly, LLC $439,000 $520,800 $930,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Sound Mechanical, Inc. $323,900 1-9 C ✓

W&M Sprinkler-NYC, LLC dba W&M 
Fire Protection Services $416,000 $475,000 $878,000

1-6 W
1-8 C ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools
Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.22 - PLUMBING

Eastern Energy Services, LLC $1,666,000 $1,793,000 $3,384,000

1-6 W
1-8 C ✓ ✓

Ferguson Mechanical Contractors, LLC $1,517,000 $1,622,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

J&B Mechanical Contractors, Inc. $1,479,000 $1,534,000

$2,985,000
(no statement)

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

P&D Mechanical, Inc. $1,705,000 $1,750,000 $3,385,000

1-3 W
1-6 C ✓ ✓

Perfectly Plumb, LLC $1,803,985 1-6 W ✓ No Statement

Performance Plumbing & Heating, LLC $1,595,971 1-9 C ✓ No Statement

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.23 - HVAC

CONTRACTOR NAME

CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID ADDENDA BID BOND

Cutler ES 

11A

West Side 

16A Cutler ES West Side

Allstate Construction Co. $5,998,000 $6,110,000 $11,987,000 $0 N/A $0 $0 N/A $0
1-6
1-8 ✓ ✓

Action Air Systems, Inc. $5,968,000 $5,992,000 $0 N/A $0 $0 N/A $0

1-6
1-5 ✓ ✓

B-G Mechanical Contractors $6,647,000 $6,687,000 $13,234,000 $0 N/A $0 $0 N/A $0 ✓ ✓ ✓

Ferguson Mechanical Co., Inc. $6,487,000 $6,582,000 $0 N/A $0 $0 N/A $0 ✓ ✓ ✓

M.J. Daly, LLC $6,581,000 $6,594,000 $13,075,000 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 ✓ ✓ ✓

P&D Mechanical Inc. $6,644,000 $6,772,880 $13,081,458 N/A N/A $0 N/A N/A $0

1-6
1-8 ✓ ✓

Performance Plumbing & Heating $7,493,799 TBD TBD ✓ ✓ No

Pro-Mech, Inc. $6,293,800 $6,451,800 N/A N/A N/A N/A

1-6

✓ ✓

DiRienzo Mechanical Contractors, Inc. $7,399,542 $0 $0 1-8 ✓ ✓

Alternate - Temp. Controls Manufacturer: Schneider Electric USA, Inc. StruxureWare

Alternate - Temp. Controls Manufacturer: Siemens Building Technologies, Inc. Apogee/Desigo

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

ALTERNATE Temp. 

Controls Manufacturer: 

Schneider Electric USA, 

Inc. StruxureWare

BOTH 

SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE 

Temp. Controls 

Schneider 

Electric  

ALTERNATE Temp. 

Controls Manufacturer: 

Siemens Building 

Technologies, Inc. 

Apogee/Desig

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO 

ALTERNATE 

Temp. Controls 

Siemens 

Building Tech



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.26 - ELECTRICAL

Ferguson Electric Company, Inc. $1,932,000 $2,172,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Custom Electric, Inc. $2,134,949 $2,274,949 $4,400,000

1-6 W
1-8 C ✓ ✓

Dicin Electric Co. $2,424,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Electrical Contractors, Inc. $2,312,000 $2,467,000 $4,667,900

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

JE Shea Electric $2,356,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

AM Electric Co., LLC $2,312,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS

System One, LLC $859,147 1-9 ✓ ✓

Net Services, LLC $1,004,000 $1,028,000

1-6
1-9 ✓ ✓

Consolidated Electric Inc. $1,014,970 $1,077,440 $2,091,000

1-6
1-9
1-9 ✓ ✓

Electrical Contractors, Inc. $1,023,000 $1,054,000 $2,023,500

1-6
1-8
1-9 ✓ ✓

JKS Systems $1,001,143 1-6 ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.27s - SECURITY

AM Electrical Company, LLC $343,000 $394,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ N/A

Consolidated Electric Inc. $281,030 $302,235 $583,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓

N/A

Electrical Contractors, Inc. $257,500 $298,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

JKS Systems $986,169 $1,011,256

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Net Services, LLC $256,000 $288,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ N/A

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.28 - FIRE ALARM

Dicin Electric Co., Inc. $298,350 $299,850 $594,200

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ N/A

Net Services, LLC $288,000 $297,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ N/A

AM Electric Company, LLC $332,250 $371,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ N/A

JE Shea Electric, Inc. $300,000 1-9 C ✓ N/A

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE 2.31 - SITEWORK

Colossale Concrete, Inc. $4,533,810 1-9 C ✓ ✓

C.J. Fucci, Inc. $5,912,780 $6,966,963 $12,395,000
1-6 W
1-8 C ✓ ✓

Gerber Construction Inc. $4,824,000 $5,533,000 $10,357,000

1-6 W
1-8 C ✓ ✓

Giordano Construction Co., Inc. $5,449,000 $6,798,000 $12,200,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Loureiro Contractors, Inc. $5,998,310 1-8 C ✓ ✓

Mather Corporation $5,598,000 $6,359,000 $11,900,000  ✓ ✓

Milton C. Beebe & Sons, Inc. $4,792,986 $6,303,307 $11,036,293

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Mizzy Construction, Inc. $6,284,000 $7,476,000 $13,670,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

Richards Corporation $4,663,777 $5,436,777 $10,070,554

1-6 W
1-8 C ✓ ✓

Waters Construction Co., Inc. $11,005,000

1-6 W
1-9 C ✓ ✓

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
CUTLER ES          

BASE BID

WEST SIDE ES 

BASE BID

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBO        

BASE BID

ADDENDA BID BOND



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.06 - ARCHITECTURAL CABINETS AND WOODWORK AND 2.10 - GENERAL TRADES

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBO BID 

PACKAGES 2.06 & 

2.10

COMBO BID TOTAL 

ALTERNATE NO. 9
ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Connecticut Carpentry Corporation $1,944,500 $38,940 1-9 ✓ ✓

OWI Contractors, LLC $2,189,258 No Bid 1-8 ✓ ✓



West Side Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.21 - FIRE PROTECTION AND 2.23 - HVAC

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBINATION 

BID PACKAGES 

2.21 & 2.23

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

M.J. Daly, LLC $7,089,800 1-6 ✓ ✓



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.21 - FIRE PROTECTION AND 2.23 - HVAC

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBINATION 

BID PACKAGES 

2.21 & 2.23

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

 m

M.J. Daly, LLC $6,973,500 1-9 C ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.21 - FIRE PROTECTION AND 2.23 - HVAC

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBINATION 

BID PACKAGES 

2.21 & 2.23

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

M.J. Daly, LLC $13,955,000

1-6W
1-9 C ✓ ✓



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES 2.22 - PLUMBING AND 2.23 - HVAC

Ferguson Mechanical $7,917,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

P & D Mechanical $8,349,000 1-8 ✓ ✓

Performance Plumbing & Heating $8,983,792 1-9 ✓ No

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

CONTRACTOR NAME
COMBO BASE 

BID 2.22 & 2.23



West Side Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES 2.22 - PLUMBING AND 2.23 - HVAC

Ferguson Mechanical $8,142,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

P & D Mechanical $8,522,880 1-6 ✓ ✓

CONTRACTOR NAME
COMBO BASE 

BID 2.22 & 2.23
ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES 2.22 - PLUMBING AND 2.23 - HVAC

P & D Mechanical $16,466,458
1-5 W
1-7 C ✓ ✓

CONTRACTOR NAME

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBINATION 

BIDS TOTAL

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.26 - ELECTRICAL AND 2.28 - FIRE ALARM

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBO BID 

PACKAGES 2.26 & 

2.28

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

JE Shea Electric, Inc. $2,564,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Dicin Electric Co., Inc. $2,722,350 1-9 ✓ ✓



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.26 - ELECTRIC, 2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS AND 2.27s - SECURITY

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBINATION 

BID PACKAGES 

2.26, 2.27d & 2.27s

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Electrical Contractors, Inc. $3,491,400 1-9 ✓ ✓

Wayne J. Griffin Electric, Inc. $3,523,000 1-9 ✓ ✓



Cutler Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS AND 2.27S - SECURITY

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBO BID 

PACKAGES 2.27d 

& 2.27s

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Consolidated Electric, Inc. $1,296,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Net Services, LLC $1,304,000 1-6 ✓ ✓



West Side Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS AND 2.27S - SECURITY

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBO BID 

PACKAGES 2.27d 

& 2.27s

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Net Services, LLC $1,249,000 1-9 ✓ ✓

Consolidated Electric, Inc. $1,379,675 1-6 ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES 2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS AND 2.27s - SECURITY

CONTRACTOR NAME

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBINATION 

BIDS TOTAL

ADDENDA

WEST SIDE

CUTLER

BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Consolidated Electric, Inc. $2,621,625

1-6
1-9 ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES 2.26 - ELECTRICAL, 2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS AND 2.27s - SECURITY

CONTRACTOR NAME

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBINATION 

BIDS TOTAL

ADDENDA

WEST SIDE

CUTLER

BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Electrical Contractors, Inc. $7,215,400 1-8 ✓ ✓

Wayne J. Griffin Electric $7,312,000
1-6
1-9 ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES 2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS, 2.27s - SECURITY AND 2.28 - FIRE ALARM

CONTRACTOR NAME

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBINATION 

BIDS TOTAL

ADDENDA

WEST SIDE

CUTLER

BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Net Services, LLC $3,118,000

1-9 C
1-6 W ✓ ✓



West Side Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.06 - ARCHITECTURAL CABINETS AND WOODWORK AND 2.10 - GENERAL TRADES

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBO BID 

PACKAGES 2.27d 

& 2.27s

COMBO BID TOTAL 

ALTERNATE NO. 14
ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Connecticut Carpentry Corporation $1,985,700 $38,940 1-6 ✓ ✓

OWI Contractors, LLC $2,130,596 No Bid 1-8 ✓ ✓



Groton Elementary Schools

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES 2.06 - ARCHITECTURAL CABINETS AND WOODWORK AND 2.10 - GENERAL TRADES

CONTRACTOR NAME

BOTH SCHOOLS 

COMBINATION 

BIDS TOTAL

COMBO BID 

TOTAL 

ALTERNATE NO. 

__________

ADDENDA

WEST SIDE

CUTLER

BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

OWI Contractors $4,190,660 No Bid

1-6
1-4 ✓ ✓



West Side Elementary School

Groton, Connecticut

March 5, 2020

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGES  2.26 - ELECTRICAL, 2.27d - TELE/DATA/COMMUNICATIONS AND 2.27s - SECURITY

CONTRACTOR NAME

COMBO BID 

PACKAGES 2.26, 

2.27d & 2.27s

ADDENDA BID BOND

CTDAS 

UPDATE 

STATEMENT

Electrical Contractors, Inc. $3,724,000 1-6 ✓ ✓

Wayne J. Griffin Electric $3,789,000 1-6 ✓ ✓


